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ABSTRACT 

Afghanistan endows enormous renewable and nonrenewable resources as a primary impetus for de-
velopment of energy and agriculture. The percentage of the population whose access to the essential 
daily necessities for having a healthy life is among the lowest in the world. This dilemma chiefly refers 
to the rural and remote communities in Afghanistan. In terms of rural societies, sustainable develop-
ment is a decision-making strategy that balances social, economic, technical, institutional, and envi-
ronmental aspects that assures the present needs of humankind, considering the future anticipation 
simultaneously. The concept developed in this study targets achieving the 2030 sustainable develop-
ment goals (SDGs), which are appropriate for rural and remote residents’ lifestyle change and im-
provement in Afghanistan. Setting measurable sustainability indicators is indispensable for the pro-
ductive invention of a sustained plane for a sustainable rural community. This study proposes a sus-
tainable mechanism for Afghanistan's rural development by confirming the 2030 sustainable devel-
opment 17 Goals (SDGs). Among these SDGs, the designed framework (methodology) meets 11 goals 
directly and the rest of 6 goals indirectly.  Besides, the proposed framework propounds a novel solu-
tion and involves all crucial segments of routine healthy life in rural Afghanistan. It consecrated crite-
ria that fit the real-life anticipations and can lead the rural communities toward self-sufficiency for 
long-run sustainability.  Based on the academic research and experts' judgment methods, overall anal-
ysis procedures can fit as an analogy, especially for other communities and developing countries as a 
pilot project. 
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1. Introduction  

The 2030 agenda for sustainable development goals 
(SDGs) principally encompasses humanity and our planet 
challenges, consisting of 17 main goals and 169 sub-tar-
gets, unanimously adopted by the United Nations General 
Assembly on September 2015 [1]. For developed nations, 
implementing the GSDs 2030 and achieving target mill-
stones would be an easy task. Whereas developing coun-
tries encounter knotty challenges to practice the GSDs 
2030 milestones and attain the goals. Among these bottle-
necks can remind few such as weak governance and man-
agement, lack of expertise and resources, inadequate na-
tional and international collaborations behavior,  

From the vulnerability point of view, in the 21st cen-
tury, the world becomes likely a small village. In which de-
veloped and developing nations directly affect each other, 
that necessitate a mutual liability. In this regard, by refer-
ring to the past, international assistance is definitely at the 
top list of the financial and technical support to Afghani-
stan. Because of the present situation of Afghanistan, 
thousands of rural communities in Afghanistan depend 
solely on traditional lifestyles and rarely have access to 
electricity, drinking water, and food for their routine. This 

study is conducted to offer real-life solutions to this prob-
lem. According to the National Solidarity Program (NSP), 
as of 2007, 42000 villages are referred to as rural settle-
ments in Afghanistan [2]. According to [3], nearly 4% of 
rural households have access to electricity in Afghanistan. 
Over 20.4% of the rural population cannot meet the mini-
mum level of dietary energy required to sustain a healthy 
life. According to the Ministry of Public Health [4] of Af-
ghanistan, most cities suffer from poor air quality and 
overcrowding due to rural settlement in the big cities. 
That caused to rank the capital of Afghanistan (Kabul city) 
among the ten top dirtiest cities in the world [5].  

On the other hand, countries are bounded by interna-
tional agreements. The Paris Summit on climate change 
was put in action with a unanimous agreement of 195 sig-
natories and 179 parties on 12 December 2015 at the 
twenty-first session of the Conference of the Parties to the 
UN (United Nations) (Officially registered on 4 November 
2016, No. 54113). Afghanistan representative at the UN, 
signed this agreement on 22 April 2016 [6]. According to 
the [7], "The Paris Agreement central aim is to strengthen 
the global response to the threat of climate change by 
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keeping a global temperature rise this century well below 2 
degrees Celsius above pre-industrial levels and to pursue 

efforts to limit the temperature increase even further to 1.5 
degrees Celsius." 

 
Figure 1. Mr. Mahmoud Saikal (Ambassador extraordinary and plenipotentiary permanent representative of the Islamic Republic 

of Afghanistan at the UN) signed the Paris Agreement on climate changes [8]. 

The Paris agreement assigns essential international re-
sponsibilities for ensuring a peaceful sound planet. In like 
manner, the 2030 Agenda for Sustainable Development 
Goals (SDGs) is another cross-boundary collaborative ef-
fort to be achieved. Although the accepted agreement that 
the world we live in is steadily polluting air and the green-
house gas emissions continue in an umpteen quantity, re-
newable energy is the only hope for a sustainable energy 
resource for greenhouse gases free atmosphere. Based on 
the aforesaid global accountability, there are many oppor-
tunities to utilize, which are viable collaboration aims for 
developed and developing to combat climate change, and 
provide sustainable energy for socio-economic develop-
ment in order to fulfill the international agreements.  

2. Objectives 

As a fact, raising expectations for self-sufficiency (at any 
pillar of socio-economic sustainability) beyond a doubt 
will increase the communities' attitude, capacity, and 
standard. It has known the key to meeting the goals, but 
inadequate long-term prospects turn into false hope. Au-
thors in [2] indicate some points as lesson-learned to be 
cautious, which caused rural electrification project failure 
in Afghanistan due to an immature electrification policy. 
Referring to the world best practices, the concept of 

micro-development in sustainability would be very prac-
tical, requiring a multi-dimensional investigation of differ-
ent scenarios to reach an optimum solution for long-run 
sustainability. 

Overall, this effort aims to formulate an exhaustive 
framework for the socio-economic developments of Af-
ghanistan's rural and remote communities. The proposed 
framework comprises five pillars of sustainability, includ-
ing the 2030 SDGs, initiated based on the scientific theo-
ries, expert judgments, real-world lessons-learned (sam-
ple case studies around the world), and at last, a fixable 
and suitable model, particularly for Afghanistan to pro-
vide the follows facilities: 

1- Twenty-four-hour reliable electricity supply for resi-
dential and public facilities  

2- Drinking water supply and water purification 

3- Water supply for agriculture (greenhouse) 

4- Enhancing food security through the production of 
meat and egg by forming local farms 

5- Ensuring equity between the rural and urban life 

6- Building local capacity and empower human rights   

7- Improving the socio-economic through creating tem-
porary and permeant jobs  
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8- At last, forming self-sufficiency by changing to a 
healthy lifestyle for long-run sustainability. 

Sustainability adaption can be different from country to 
country and community to community in the same coun-
try due to social, cultural, environmental, institutional, po-
litical, geographical, economic, technical, and many more 
decisive factors. Therefore, for this model, pre-defined 
sustainability pillars are outlined as well. 

3. Methodology 

In rural society, sustainable development is a decision-
making strategy that balances social, economic, technical, 
institutional, and environmental aspects, simultaneously 
considering present and future generations' needs [9,10]. 
Setting measurable sustainability indicators is indispen-
sable for the efficacious invention of a sustained plane for 
a sustainable rural community. Today's cutting-edge re-
newable energy technologies should propound the sus-
tainability culture at the rural community level and imple-
ment the necessary plans to achieve national and interna-
tional sustainable goals. For instance, the European en-
ergy supply objectives (20-20-20) by 2020, where 20 
stands for a reduction of 20% of greenhouse gas emis-
sions, increasing energy efficiency by 20%, and 20% pro-
duction of electricity from renewable energy sources, 
compared to 1990 levels, respectively [11]. 

Among energy utilities, buildings consume a significant 
amount of energy that can be different based on energy 
consumption culture from country to country. Since Af-
ghanistan is not an industrial country, the energy con-
sumption is most likely residential. Buildings consume 
40% of the total energy and emit 30% of greenhouse gas 
emissions (GHGs) worldwide [12]. There are some case 
studies [13–15] conducted for India, Chili, and Nicaragua, 
which are almost in conformance to the present situation 
of Afghanistan, that can be counted as a useful reference. 

For proper planning for rural communities, the house-
hold characteristics must be collected through survey 
tools and techniques. These characteristics can contain 
much information, with at least some essentials as [13–
15]: number of households, land holdings, labor and de-
mographic, gender percentage, ages, literacy percentage, 
number of educated residence, immigration information, 
infrastructures accessibility (paved road, dirt road, trail, 
hospital, etc.), access to energy, access to clean water, av-
erage household income, local expectations, available re-
sources, transformable options, and many more. The 
abovementioned endeavors can be achieved in three main 
steps:  

− Developing program concept 

− Conducting feasibility studies 

− Designing a sustainable solution 

These steps consist of many sub-activities (Figure 2). This 
study solely concentrated on the conceptualization of an 
exhaustive framework within the SDGs scope. 

4. Call for global collaboration 

Although SDGs pertaining to the global contribution at the 
country-level, everyone (especially scholars and research-
ers) is liable to partake in these crucial trends to rescue 
our planet for current and future generations. This partic-
ipation can take in various forms within a flexible mecha-
nism at different levels of engagement. For this reason, we 
have resorted to initiating international collaborative ef-
forts to assist developing countries in climate change. This 
collaboration will consist of direct and indirect engage-
ments within a managed framework. Thriving the concept 
(as a pilot project) can attract further investment on the 
concept by national and international donors throughout 
the country. That offers a transparent process and cost-ef-
fective service for rural self-sufficiency. While at the pre-
sent many national and international entities could not 
spend their targeted budgets for each fiscal year. Luckily, 
this concept covers various aspects that can be invested in 
many different budget lines. So, this concept can be ap-
plied to specific programs but also in the future. It can be 
counted as a roadmap for other assistance in this regard. 
There are many funds to cover such projects like science 
and technology research partnership for sustainable de-
velopment (SATREPS) program by the government of Ja-
pan and many more that deal with global issues at the de-
veloping countries to improve societies' socio-economic 
status through joint researches of international communi-
ties for the sake of ensuring real-world implementation of 
the research’s outcomes [1]. To prosecute the SDGs goals, 
the ultimate aim of such programs is to develop an inno-
vative mechanism to resolve global issues through ac-
quirement new knowledge and advancement of science 
and technology by enhancing partner countries' research 
and development capabilities. 

Feasibility study of the SDGs (17 goals) of the targeted 
society to identify the socio-economic improvement op-
portunities and affordability in conformity with the cur-
rent status. The initial objective of this feasibly is to reveal 
the exhaustiveness of the proposed mechanism and show 
how the mechanism can play a significant part of SDGs. It 
indicates the effectiveness of the proposed mechanism at 
national (for Afghanistan) and international levels for 
long-run sustainability.  

5. The proposed conceptual model 

Reference to the literature, it is important to form several 
standpoints to apply all sustainability pillars in the context 
of a sustainable rural community. Central to the entire dis-
cipline of the sustainable rural community is the concept 
of multi-dimension pillars to concur with every society's 
unique environmental, ecological, social, cultural, 
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economic, institutional, political, and technological condi-
tions. The proffered conceptual framework is a typical 
model that can be suitably modified case by case based on 
the actual needs of the communities (add or remove fea-
tures and facilities), but at all the concept can be unique.  

At this stage (concept development), the basic SWOT 
(strengths, weaknesses, opportunities, and threats) anal-
ysis planning tool is recommended to identify and 

compare the effectiveness of the proposed model. It is 
noteworthy that for further investigation, subtler tools 
and techniques will be applied, such as contingency anal-
ysis, root and cause analysis, risk and impact analysis and 
so on, at the following stages of assessment. The concep-
tual scheme for this program presents a big picture of an-
ticipation, which each segment needs to be explored in de-
tail from different perspectives (Figure 3). 

 
Figure 2. A conceptual electricity and water supply micro-grid model for socio-economic development in Afghanistan  

 
Figure 3. A conceptual scheme for the program lifecycle. 

However, details representing the conceptual scheme for 
the program lifecycle are out of this study scope; local re-
source utilization as return on investment for self-suffi-
ciency, sustainable human capacity and food security, and 

lifestyle change are the primary targets. Public awareness, 
biomass energy utilization in from secondary form of en-
ergy, fertilizer technology development, and many more 
can be the second priority.  
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The conceptual scheme for the program lifecycle concen-
trates on achieving the 2030 SDGs objectives. This scheme 
tends to attain all the 17 SDGs by using direct and indirect 
approaches. As it seems in Figure 3, by the perfect deploy-
ment of this scheme, 11 SDGs can be achieved directly. The 
rest of the 6 SDGs can also be achieved to some extends, 
linked with the direct SDGs. The conceptual scheme of the 
program management and operation addresses the main 

millstone, which required a detailed interpretation in 
terms of program and project management standards (in-
itiation, planning, execution, monitoring, and closure). It 
seems the implementation of this program will dedicate 
many resources (human, capital, time, technology, exper-
tise, local participation, etc.) compared to the rest of the 
program phases (Figure 4).  

 
Figure 4. A conceptual scheme of the program management and operation. 

Stakeholders' positive engagement at any stage of a pro-
gram or project adds value to the trends and warrants the 
successful completion of the program. In this scheme, ten-
tatively, stakeholder's engagements are highlighted. As 
shown in Figure 4, this study focuses on the primary first 
element (development of the program concept) of the pro-
gram management and operation conceptual scheme.   

5.1.  Particularities of the proposed mechanism 

The proposed framework demonstrates with some merit 
that denotes its preference for rural development and 
achieving the SDGs goals as follows:  

− Exhaustivity: In the context of a rural community, this 
framework deals with all crucial segments for a 
healthy life.      

− Flexibility: The proposed framework can be modified 
and adapted to the real-life situation from economic, 
technical, social, and size perspectives. 

− Independency: Most likely, the residence is affected 
by government politics that depends on many factors. 
At the same time, this concept assures rural independ-
ence to government politics and economic transitions 
that bring self-sufficiency.  

− Self-sufficiency: Due to many factors, especially rural 
distance, rural social and cultural varieties often re-
main strange from standard services. So, this frame-
work focalized on rural self-sufficiency, considering 
fortifying factors in assistance this phenomenon.     

− In addition, this framework draws a particular joint-
research scheme considering optimum effectuality of 

the involved parties (international researches institu-
tions and partner country) and Official Development 
Assistance (ODA). 

− Also, it can facilitate joint-researches procedures and 
methods case by case to ensure proper utilization of 
the research outcomes and human capacity develop-
ment within the program timeframe.  

5.2.   Adaption of the sustainability pillars in the context of 
rural communities  

The most important criteria for sustainable energy pro-
duction and consumption are accessibility, affordability, 
disparity, safety, use efficiency, supply and production 
efficiency, cost-effectiveness, and environmental impacts 
on air, water, and soil quality [16]. The concept of sustain-
able energy development has been introduced based on 
these pillars, which are discussed in detail [17,18]:  

− Technical sustainability 

− Economic sustainability 

− Institutional sustainability 

− Environmental sustainability 

− Social sustainability 

5.2.1. Technical 

As mentioned before, sustainability pillars' adaption can 
be varying from place to place due to many social, envi-
ronmental, economic, technical, and institutional reasons. 
First and foremost, the local resources' investigation must 
explore the economy of resources, life cycle, and human 
design. To prosper local resources (human and natural) to 
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ensure self-sufficiency, the available primary natural re-
sources need to be transforming to the secondary (useful) 
form of resources, which needs customized technologies 
and expertise that can be attained with the help of national 
and international collaborations. In this regard, the multi-
national companies (which are a pioneer in any type of in-
dustrial and agricultural technologies in the globe) coop-
eration under the specific program for producing custom-
ized and affordable products while providing training 
would be a great opportunity.  

5.2.2. Environmental 

However, the primary forms of energy resources provide 
irrefutable benefits for the rural; on the other hand, these 
resources always accumulate by overloading our atmos-
phere with greenhouse gas emissions and a steady tem-
perature rise. Therefore, global warming comes into inter-
national focus. According to the findings [19], electricity 
production and consumption emit ten Giga-tones or ap-
proximately 37% of global emissions. 

Turning to the recent investigations, the global issues 
have become increasingly complex and particularly se-
vere in developing countries that cannot be solved by any 
single country alone. On the planet we live, willingly or un-
willingly, we are committed to contributing global es-
teems to ensure the SDGs and hinder the developing na-
tions' direct and indirect impacts. However, controlling all 
these impacts would not be possible, but still optimistic 
about mitigating controllable issues (global warming) and 
assisting humanity in a severe situation. Global warming 
will hit poorer countries hardest likely to suffer the big-
gest increase in hot days and extreme weather because of 
climate change. Somehow the developing nations play a 
significant role in global warming due to use of primary 
energy resources; meanwhile, some reports [20,21] claim 
that "this is inverse to the generally accepted responsibil-
ity for climate change, which falls mainly on rich countries 
that benefited early on from industry, and thus have his-
torically high emissions, compared with poorer countries 
that have only begun catching up in the past few decades".  

5.2.3. Economic 

Reference to the reports, localized-standalone services of-
fer a cost-effective alternative to expensive national facili-
ties extension in rural and remote areas of the world. Con-
sidering the demography of Afghanistan, predominantly 
settlements are small and remote, with approximately 
78% of the total population in the rural [22]. An adequate 
socio-economic model can be feasible for rural Afghani-
stan in practice to address sufficient needs, fundamental 
adjustments under the necessity of the present situation. 

5.2.4. Social 

Public participation is a must for every project and pro-
gram's success, and more importantly, it is for their con-
tinued operation for long-run productivity. While refer-
ence to the past experience and direct observation from 

the implemented projects at rural communities, the public 
participation was not satisfactory. In some cases, public 
involvement in the rural areas negatively impacted a pos-
itive contribution. This intimate that public participation 
in Afghanistan's rural communities is more complicated 
than it seems due to many cultural, ideological, and many 
more factors. So, it can be counted the main reasons be-
hind the failure of most projects in the rural areas of Af-
ghanistan. Just realizing these factors and taking local 
measures and solutions can be serviceable. Mainly these 
bottlenecks are due to lack of well-understanding of com-
munities' social and traditional principles. 

Due to the importance of public participation, special at-
tention should be paid to this matter. For instance, con-
vincing the communities with a simple but important 
question might be rise, such as: Why will the program be 
deployed? What are the aims behind this program? What 
are the program's short and long terms benefits? Who will 
govern and keep running this program? Other similar 
questions may arise and should be answered carefully in 
their own language and potential (community leaders and 
influential).  

5.2.5. Institutional 

Investigate energy-related socio-economic sustainability 
factors and put them forward in energy policy for long-run 
sustainability, such as community involvement, social ac-
ceptability, economic affordability, and equity [23]. The 
policy and regulation are a principle or a course of action, 
which it applies to maintain or change the status of tar-
geted scopes. Considering the policy and planning cycle, 
setting objectives, anticipations costing, implementation 
and monitoring measures are an elementary part of suc-
cessful program delivery. Therefore, the institutional pil-
lar is a multi-dimensional endeavor requiring a decent ex-
pert team with careful analysis of needs to ensure the pro-
gram's applicability and long-run sustainability. Develop-
ing coherent policies and regulations in light of the SDGs 
as a benchmark for a customized framework for different 
communities in different types of requirements (specific 
area) will accelerate reaching the goals.  

6. Achieving the 2030 global agenda for 17 sustaina-

ble development goals (SDGs) 

The 2030 global agenda for 17 SDGs is underlying the 
broad theme of sustainability, which is put in force to 
transform the planet and humankind positively by 2030.  
These 17 SDGs are poverty alleviation, sustainable food, 
nutrition, and agriculture, healthy life maintaining, decent 
and continuous education, gender equality, water sanita-
tion, sustainable energy provision, economic growth, re-
silient infrastructures, global inequality mitigation, peace-
fully amicable settlement, enhance moderation between 
consumption and production, combat climate changes, 
natural resources, and environmental conservation, pro-
tect the ecosystem, socio-economic improvement of the 
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societies, and strengthen multinational collaboration and 
partnership. 

Establishing a self-sufficient mechanism based on the 
repetitive lifecycle of assets can create temporary and per-
meant jobs to alleviate poverty. Then can follow by food 
security, nutrition, and agriculture facilities for maintain-
ing a healthy life. Burning wood, leaf, and animal dung tra-
ditionally for cooking in rural areas contributes to global 
warming and accumulates with diseases and solid waste 
[24]. For this purpose, wide-spreading solar cookers, solar 
water heaters, solar driers (for harvesting and storing 
products) will significantly contribute to maintaining a 
healthy community.  Undoubtedly, rural access to crucial 
life services paves the way for decent education, gender 
equity, and economic growth that can cause global ine-
quality mitigation, peacefully amicable settlement, and 
natural resources and environmental conservation.  

Microeconomy has been investigated broadly in the lit-
erature [20,21,25–27]. One of the newest findings pointed 
out a micro-level economy paradigm focused on evidence 
from a home appliance manufacturer [21].  In this study, 
the implementation of the circular economy at three lay-
ers' micro, meso, and macro levels are explored. In an-
other study, the small open economy within a micro-
founded model is proposed within government bonds 
[25]. This model deals with technological spillovers from 
the global economy to the small open economy succeeds 
in replicating the main macroeconomic and bond pricing. 
Chad Nilep [20] describes the behavior of four Japanese 
American individuals and claims that these individuals 
can adapt to maintain the state's wealth (as micro-econ-
omy). Also, this study reveals that the political economy in 
the fields of linguistic and cultural anthropology has in 
common with economics. A cross-country comparison 
study based on the micro-economy analysis is performed 
in [26]. This study targets three countries Japan, France, 
and Netherlands from combining firm, industry and coun-
try-level. That can provide an in-depth observation of af-
fordable options for micro-economy from different points 
of view. Paulo N. Figueiredo [27] presents a case study 
from Brazil on the micro-level technological capability ac-
cumulation in developing economies that categorize these 
capabilities into six groups.  

However, the abovementioned micro-economy theo-
rem applications are varied to our scenario. Still, all these 
studies confirm the effectiveness of micro-economy for 
long-term sustainability that can be applied to the pro-
posed framework. Overall, agriculture and aviculture 
farms' on-farm and off-farm applications can be profitable 
for Afghanistan rural communities' prosperity. 

Relying on the agriculture-based economy refers to 
early in the post-World War 2 with a slogan that "Getting 
agriculture moving," prerequisites and exigencies [28]: 

− Adaptive-productive technologies  

− Access to competitive markets 

− Storage and warehousing facilities  

− Incentive and remunerative programs 

Energy security is concerned for a sustainable supply, 
which defines the accessibility of energy supply at an af-
fordable price in an environmentally friendly atmosphere 
[17]. Among available theorems, the green economy is an 
appropriate selection for balancing resource consumption 
for the purpose of energy provision. This theorem con-
cerns the risk of environmental degradation and re-
sources scarcity and navigating their impacts on national 
economies [29]. 

Globally, enormous attention has been paid to switch to 
renewable energy sources and consider the sustainability 
dimensions from technological innovation to its implica-
tions for greenhouse gas emissions, energy costs reduc-
tion, and dependence on technologies with catastrophic 
potential [17,30]. For a rapid economic transformation in 
rural and remote communities in Afghanistan, among all 
the effective factors, the below are known salient: 

− Rising labor productivity and capacity 

− Rural saving mechanism  

− Centralized individual income scheme  

− Encourage investment at national and local levels 

− Maintain capital availability for operation and future 
expansion  

− Individual and centralized community-level saving 
mechanism  

− Innovation programs for productivity and marketing 

The proposed mechanism covers the dimensions men-
tioned above and tries to integrate these factors appropri-
ately. Seriously considering the challenges encounter on 
our planet, now more than ever before the need for sus-
tainability and transforming the world exists.  In addition 
to all that has been mentioned so far, it can be supposed 
that this international collaboration between interna-
tional agencies and local communities can be counted as 
an opener for Afghanistan's rural and remote communi-
ties' self-sufficiency. It can ensure national security, re-
duce poverty, and combat climate change phenomena that 
are all part of the global endeavor. 

7. Contributions of the study 

In the last two decades, many projects are implemented 
throughout Afghanistan for rural communities' empower-
ment with limited short-term revenue. The implemented 
projects demonstrate with number of deficiencies from 
different standpoints.  However, considering the Afghani-
stan situation during the past two decades would not be 
anticipated a perfect outcome from these projects. At the 
main while, there have been number of controllable fac-
tors to avoid significant shortcomings. These factors 
mainly refer to the lack of proper coordination among sec-
torial organizations were responsible for rural 
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development and the lack of proper management of pro-
ject implementation and operation.  

The proposed framework tries to deal with the causa-
tive factors that affect a rural project implementation and 
operation for long-run sustainability from the lessons 
learned. Separately the identified factors such as lack of 
the risk management plan for the entire project period 
and beyond this period, supportive plans for maintenance 
and operation, self-sufficiency plans for keeping continue 
the services as well as to expand the services by commu-
nities themselves, and creating close coordination among 
involved parties (local government, leaders, experts, ben-
eficiaries, etc.) are investigated. In the past, implemented 
projects have had focused on a specific target within lim-
ited outcomes. At the same time, this study explores a ru-
ral community all essential segments such as twenty-four-
hour electricity supply, drinking water, local food, agricul-
ture, capacity building, self-sufficiency, etc. Deployment of 
this framework will obliterate the monopolist culture that 

a unique organization controls all the projects with lim-
ited knowledge and expertise. In the proposed frame-
work, research, implementation, supervision, controlling 
and monitoring, infestation, and future innovation layers 
are based on the multi-expertise engagement to assure a 
sufficient service.   

8. Anticipated outcomes in brief 

Given figures and information in Table 1, indicate a rough 
approximation due to the nature of communities, real sit-
uation, the area of application, etc. That can vary case by 
case and community to community. The present status of 
a moderate community is a benchmark for anticipated im-
provement, obtained from direct observation and face-to-
face interviews with the residents of these communities. 
As mentioned earlier, for proper deployment of a program 
aligned with the SDGs, a customized solution for every 
community should be considered within a specific bench-
mark (the general developed concept).  

Table 1:   The anticipated outcomes from the proposed framework confirming the SDGs. 

SDGs 

The SDGs applicabil-
ity in the proposed 
conceptual frame-
work (a very rough 
approximation)  

Expected outcome (within the first five tears of the pilot project) No. Descriptions 

L
ess th

an
 3

0
%

 

L
ess th

an
 6

0
%

 

L
ess th

an
 9

0
%

 

1 Poverty alleviation:    It is expected to be a dramatic increase in residence income per capita 
(especially young students, illiterates, and women) to a level of 55-75%. 

2 Sustainable food, nutrition, 
and agriculture 

   Due to enough land availability and local constraints, it is expected to 
reach a target of up to 60%. 

3 Healthy life maintaining    
For Afghanistan's communities, this target is much dependent on culture 
and mores than facilities and possibly. So, maintaining lifestyle change 
can be expected under 35%. 

4 
Decent and continues educa-
tion    

Considering positive attitude toward a rapid acceptance rate of new tech-
nologies in the recent years, the decent and continuous education rate 
can be anticipated between 45-55%. 

5 Gender equality    
Local settlement availability, easy access to the work field, determined 
individual significance and outcomes; will bring gender equality in the 
long term.  

6 Water sanitation    By deploying the proposed program, access to clean and healthy water 
for drinking will reach more than 80%. 

7 Sustainable energy provision    
Rural energy consumption culture for the basic needs of electricity and 
other types of energy, within five years, the sustainable energy supply 
rate will reach nearly 70%. 

8 Economic growth    Roughly between 65-80%. 

9 Resilient infrastructures    
Due to the lack of even basic infrastructures in some rural communities,  
this goal should not be achievable as much as expected. 

10 Global inequality mitigation    
Considering the scale of this program compared to the global equality 
criteria and targets, the proposed program within medium-term of five 
years may not contribute to this trend.  

11 Peacefully amicable settlement    

Most of the rural communities are involved in agriculture and livestock 
affairs. This program will help them ensure their job security by creating 
new permanent jobs in modern agriculture (greenhouse) and aviculture 
farms.  
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12 
Enhance moderation between 
consumption and production    

Still, life expectancy remains low in rural communities in Afghanistan; 
the proposed program would be more than enough to balance local con-
sumption with production within a specific timeframe.   

13 Combat climate changes    

The primary resource of greenhouse gas emissions in rural communities 
is the use of primary resources of energy. More than expected, this goal is 
achievable by implementing this program and providing the secondary 
form of energy (clean and green).  

14 Natural resources and envi-
ronment conservation 

   
This matter is turning to Goal 13. By accessing clean and sustainable en-
ergy, the rate of demolishing forests and natural environments would be 
significantly reduced. 

15 Protect the ecosystem    This goal is somehow linked to all the previous goals, so this goal is 
achievable by maintaining the abovementioned goals.  

16 
Socio-economic improvement 
of the societies    

This goal comprises two segments of social and economic. The economic 
aspects are more manageable, while the social aspects are turning to 
some complicated indicators that will not be changeable within the life of 
this program. 

17 Strengthen multinational col-
laboration and partnership 

   Initiating such programs will contribute to international collaborations.  

9. Conclusion 

This study roughly outlined a framework to be more ex-
plored in feasibility studies and conceptualization for ru-
ral sustainability in Afghanistan. This study is designed as 
a general objective-oriented. It is prospected to interpret 
this study in a detailed technical and theoretical proposal 
for a pilot project. In addition to the technical and eco-
nomic feasibility assessments, the research and model de-
velopment stage will deal with a broad theme of studying 
the boundaries, constraints, opportunities, and challenges 
at the communities level; to define adequate thresholds of 
the population concentration in the communities, commu-
nities categorization, economic growth indicators, human 
capacity development measures, self-independency and 
lifestyle changes indices, and finally to set up scalable 
measures for climate change and poverty mitigation near 
to the fact. 

The proposed framework aims to improve the quality of 
life in rural communities in Afghanistan, meet their indis-
pensable daily expectations, motivate locals for self-suffi-
ciency for long-run sustainability, maintain a peaceful en-
vironment, reduce greenhouse gases emissions, and pre-
serve the natural environment. That directly can achieve 
the SDG 2030 goals. A multi-collaboration commitment is 
inherent to warrant the sustainability of this trend for a 
long-term operation and innovation. This commitment 
can reaffirm by intergovernmental, national and interna-
tional elites at national and local levels.  
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